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Subject: FEE siIp

From: Joyce Tucker (joyceﬁg@comcast.net)
To: * surfdr1@yahoo.com;

Date: Sunday, March 13, 2016 2:21 PM

Hi Dr. Rhodes,

Attached is the fee slip that you requested. Nationwide insurance company did pay on the claim. You'd stated
that you were told $56,000 billed out on this patient. I don't know how much more she was treated after I

stopped billing for your office; but, $22,776 was billed out from 07/02/ 13-01/15/14 from this office. You were
paid $8,283.98 with adjustments of $1,910.64, leaving a balance of $12,571.38.

Take care,

Joyce

From: Eliot Tucker [mailto:e!iotis@comcast.net]
Sent: Sunday, March 13, 2016 1:50 Pm

To: Joyce Tucker'

Subject:
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